
interior design to create a living space 
that meets their client’s needs and 
expectations. “We have a very collab-
orative approach with clients in getting 
to their realized functional and aesthetic 
goals for their spaces. We pride 
ourselves in giving clients an elevated 
experience, with clear communication, 
flawless project management, on-time 
delivery, and timeline and budget 
management,” says Foster.

Specializing in modern interior design 
that features clean lines, captivating 
textures, and carefully curated materials, 
Foster Hill Design works to create a 
welcoming and inviting atmosphere. 
“We believe that modern design can 
be both beautiful and functional and 
strive to create spaces that are not only 
visually stunning, but also livable and 
comfortable,” says Foster. Services 
include full-service design, construction, 
and remodeling, and the firm serves 
clients in the Chicago area and beyond.

“We believe a well-functioning and 
beautiful interior that personally reflects 
the inhabitant is transformative,” 
explains interior designer Nicole Foster, 
principal of Chicago’s Foster Hill 
Design. “When you have pride in your 
surroundings, and they rise up to meet 
you, getting out of bed in the morning 
is a little easier. Creating dinners for 
your family more enjoyable. And coming 
home a treat. When clients tell us they 
can’t believe they get to live in their 
space, we are so grateful. It makes our 
job rewarding.”

Foster Hill Design believes collab-
oration with clients is a vital aspect of 
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Foster Hill Design elevates home 
interiors with a design style that blends 
a thoughtful approach with modern 
elements to create a comfortable and 
functional living space. The emphasis 
is on a clean, functional aesthetic that 
prioritizes practicality and simplicity.
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